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Water/Sewer System Supplies 5/23/2008
PWU-0919 10:00 AM
Bid Tabulation
Ziebell Water Service HD Waterworks
Mid American Water, Water Products, Products, Eik Grove | Supply, Carol Stream,

Category Aurora, IL Aurora, IL Village, IL IL
I-Valves/Water No Bid $6,337.00 $5,722.00 $5,007.90
I-Couplings/Water No Bid No Bid $550.90 $450.90
II-End Couplings / Water No Bid No Bid $793.00 $748.30
IV-Pipe/Water $105.63 No Bid $3,118.60 $2,537.38
V-Castings/Water No Bid $213.50 $328.10 $286.17
VI-Repair Sleeves/Water No Bid No Bid $7,039.90 $7,476.06
Vil-Brass Fittings / Water No Bid No Bid $2,032.25 $1,856.89
VIll-Fittings/Sewer $1,713.50 $1,954.12 $2,525.45 $1,776.88
IX-Couplings/Sewer $484.00 $232.93 $417.40 $398.22
X-Pipe/Sewer $1,351.00 No Bid $1,391.46 $1,078.00
XI-Fire Hydrant
Extension/Repair Kits $829.00 $1,102.86 $891.00 $781.70
XlI-Fire Hydrants $4,878.00 $6,727.00 $6,275.00 $5,639.81
Xlll-Fire Hydrants Parts $7.,605.02 $7,511.74 $5,117.30 $5,951.43

Total Bid

As Read No Total $24,079.15 $36,202.36 $33,989.64

Total Bid

As Corrected $16,966.15 $24,079.15 $36,202.36 $33,989.64

No Bid on & Categories No Bid on 5 Categories

Partial Bid on 1 Category
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